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Cancer is a serious and terrifying disease. If you have been diagnosed with cancer, your
mind is probably filled with fear, worry, and questions. Therefore, it is extremely important to
have an honest and frank discussion with your oncologist. To better understand your disease
and treatment options, it is imperative to ask the right questions. If you are determined to
beat cancer, here are the top 10 questions you need to ask your oncologist:

1. What is the rationale for your recommended treatment and is your expectation curative
(achieving remission and long-term survival) or palliative (only improving quality of life)?

2. What are the likely side effects of treatment and how will you deal with each of them?

3. How do you plan to prevent damage to the DNA and mitochondria of my normal (healthy)
cells?

4. How many of the eleven hallmarks of cancer will you be targeting?

5. Treatment resistance, systemic toxicity, and immunosuppression are leading causes of
treatment failure and subsequent mortality. What is your plan to overcome these challenges
if they occur?

6. Every drug that is used to treat malignancies must reach the cancer cells in the tumor
environment at adequate concentrations to exert their intended cell-killing effects. Two
obstacles that exist in the tumor environment that can prevent adequate delivery of
cancer-killing substances are tumor interstitial hypertension and tumor density. What will you
be doing to overcome these obstacles?

7. Studies have shown that a significant percentage of cancer cases have their roots in diet
and lifestyle. Also, chemotherapy and radiation can lead to nutritional deficiencies. To
address these issues, what diet, lifestyle, and nutritional supplements do you recommend
that may improve my treatment outcome?
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8. Cancer cells alter their metabolism to enable rapid growth and proliferation and enable
treatment resistance. Targeting cancer metabolism as a therapeutic strategy can support
conventional therapy. To improve my treatment response, what will you be doing to target
cancer metabolism?

9. Cancer stem cells are thought to be a major cause of treatment failure, cancer
progression, metastasis, and cancer recurrence. What will you be doing to target cancer
stem cells since chemotherapy, radiation, and surgery do not target these cells and may
stimulate them to proliferate and spread?

10. The tumor stroma (non-cancer cells in a tumor) has been shown to promote cancer
initiation, progression, metastasis, and treatment resistance. Conventional cancer treatment
is designed to target cancer cells. What will you be doing to simultaneously target the tumor
stroma cells, such as cancer-associated fibroblasts and tumor-associated macrophages?

These questions will help you prepare for your appointment so you will come away from the
visit with the crucial information you need to move forward and fight cancer properly. Do not
be afraid to ask these questions. Your health and very life may be on the line, so insist on
complete answers from your oncologist. Ask a friend or family member to accompany you as
a second set of eyes and ears to listen to what the doctor says. And be sure to take notes for
later reference.

It is important to have your eyes wide open as you move forward, so please be aware that
the oncologist may not be current in his or her understanding of cancer cell biology, how to
lessen metastatic progression and improve therapeutic response using integrative therapies,
or how to prevent disease recurrence. The oncologist may not be informed about the role
that nutrition plays in fighting cancer and may mock the idea of doing anything to target
cancer hallmarks (including cancer metabolism), cancer stem cells, the tumor stroma, or
improving drug delivery to tumors, and might be dismissive of anything outside of
conventional therapy. Therefore, I urge to you also consult with a physician who possesses a
deeper understanding of the complex biology of cancer and is educated and experienced in
integrative therapies. Please do not contact my office as my practice is full and I am unable
to see new patients.
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